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F r e e d o m o f I n f o r m a t i o n A c t ( F O I A ) R e q u e s t ? 1 1 3 6 9 6

Thank you for your request dated 10 August 2017 in which you asked for the following

information from the Ministry of Justice (MoJ):

1. Disc losure o f the deta i ls o f costs t o the CPS/Ministry o f Jus t i ce d u r i n g the 2006-

2009 ext rad i t ion case o f Vincent Baj inya (Brown), Charles Munyaneza, Emmanue l
Ntezi ryayo a n d Celest in Ugi rashebuja heard at Westmins te r Magis t ra tes cou r t / H igh

Cour t (appeal).

To inc lude:

C o s t o f C P S l e g a l a s s i s t a n c e

Cost o f Cour t s t a f f a n d c o u r t t ime

2. D i s c l o s u r e o f t h e d e t a i l s o f t h e l e g a l a i d m o n i e s p a i d d u r i n g t h e 2 0 1 3 - 2 0 1 7

ext rad i t ion case o f Vincent Baj inya (Brown), Charles Munyaneza, E m m a n u e l
Nteziryayo, Celestin Ugirashebuja and Celestin Mutabaruka heard a t Wes tm ins te r
M a g i s t r a t e s c o u r t / C o u r t o f A p p e a l . 2 .

T o i n c l u d e :

C o s t o f C P S l e g a l a s s i s t a n c e

C o s t o f C o u r t s t a f f a n d c o u r t t i m e

/
3. D i s c l o s u r e o f t h e t o t a l a m o u n t p a i d b y t h e C r o w n d u r i n g t h e s e t w o e x t r a d i t i o n

c a s e s 2 0 0 6 - 0 9 , 2 0 1 3 - 2 0 1 7 .

Your request has been handied under the FOIA.

I can conf i rm that t h e M o J ho lds s o m e o f the in fo rma t ion t h a t you h a v e reques ted . Cos t s

incur red by the C r o w n / C P S w o u l d need to be s o u g h t f r o m the C r o w n P r o s e c u t i o n S e r v i c e ,

as such in format ion is the respons ib i l i ty o f t h a t o rgan isa t i on a n d hence is n o t he ld by M o J .

Y o u can con tac t the C P S at F O I U n i t A c p s . g s i . g o v . u k .



In terms of court costs, Her Majesty's Court and Tribunal Service (HMCTS) records the costs

incurred in the operation of all our courts and tribunals and carefully monitors those costs on
an ongoing basis. However, HMCTS does not record the cost of individual cases or hearings

due to the complexity and additional costs this would incur. As such this information is not
held and hence cannot be provided.

Information regarding ?legal aid monies? is held by MoJ and is accordingly provided below:

Q u e s t i o n O n e

2 0 0 6 - 2 0 0 9

Charl ies M u n y a n e z a £ 6 7 1 , 4 0 0 . 0 0

Ce les t in U g i r a s h e b u j a | £ 2 2 5 , 0 1 7 . 0 3

V i n c e n t Ba j inya £ 1 7 0 , 7 4 4 . 7 5

Please note these costs would have been incurred by the Legal Services Commission rather

than the MoJ, which was the organisation responsible for legal aid at that time.

Q u e s t i o n T w o

2013-2017

Charles Munyaneza £295,279.08

Celestin Ugirashebuja | £360,130.15
Celes t in M u t a b a r u k a | £ 3 2 2 , 5 0 4 . 9 0

E m m a n u e l N tez i r yayo | £17 ,131 .50

Question Three

O u r r e s p o n s e s t o ques t i ons o n e and t w o a n s w e r ques t i on three.

Note above costs include VAT and disbursements, disbursements are expenses incurred

which although paid by the LAA directly to the providers, are then paid to other parties
involved in the case.

The Legal Aid Agency records data on legal aid awarded at the police station, magistrates

court and prison law on a computer system which does not allow LAA to uniquely identify
individuals, as it records names but does not record full names, dates of birth or any other

means to allow the conclusive identification of specific individuals at this stage of the justice
process. Therefore figures have been provided for these areas of the legal aid scheme only

when the LAA have been able to verify that such claims relate to the individuals named in

your request.



We h a v eanswe redy o u r request based o n t h e extradit ion proceedings related t o these
i n d i v i d u a l s ,which took p lace a t Westminster Magistrates Cour tandt h e Royal Courtso f
Justice. in o u r previous response t o you wea l s o inc luded sums regardingrelatedc i v i l
proceedings. inl i g h t o f y o u r specifically requesting data regarding extradition proceedings,

this FOIA enquiry has been answeredon t h i s basis only.

Legal aid is avaitable fo r both Magistrate and Crown Court cases, subject to them being
means tested. Applicants that meet the relevant means thresholds may still be required to
pay a significant contribution to the costs of their defence. The Government has cut the fees

paid to lawyers in criminal legal aid cases to ensure legal aid represents better value for the
taxpayer.

Appeal Rights

If you are not satisfied with this response you have the right to request an internal review by
responding in writing to one of the addresses below within two months of the date of this

response.

a ta .access (O jus t i ce .as i .gov .uk

Data Access and Compliance Unit, Ministry of Justice, 10.38, 102 Petty France, London,
SW1H 9AJ

You do have the right to ask the Information Commissioner's Office (ICO) to investigate any
aspect of your complaint. However, please note that the ICO is likely to expect internal
complaints procedures to have been exhausted before beginning their investigation.

Yours sincerely

i n f o r m a t i o n G o v e r n a n c e

L e g a l A l d A g e n c y


